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AAA-ICDR® Partners with Small Business Associations Nationwide to 
Provide Fast, Cost Effective Dispute Resolution Resources 

 
New Initiative Offers Free ADR Resources and Education to  

Small Businesses and Entrepreneurs 
 
NEW YORK (September 26, 2024)— The American Arbitration Association® (AAA®), its international 
division, the International Centre for Dispute Resolution® (ICDR®), and its recently acquired subsidiary 
ODR.com, proudly announce the creation of a dedicated small business and entrepreneur resources platform. 
Developed in partnership with leading small business associations nationwide, the AAA aims to educate and 
provide dispute resolution solutions and resources for start-ups, entrepreneurs and small businesses. 
 
This initiative addresses the growing demand for accessible and efficient alternatives to litigation, driven by a 
record number of start-ups launching in 2024. In response to this trend, the AAA has accelerated its vision of 
delivering fair, impartial and efficient conflict resolution solutions tailored to the unique needs of small 
businesses. 
 
“After engaging with numerous small business associations across the U.S., it became evident that alternative 
dispute resolution (ADR) has significant potential to address the challenges small businesses face in resolving 
conflicts,” said Angela Romero Valedon, AAA Vice President. “Our first steps include listening to, educating 
and collaborating with small business communities to roll out various resolution options over the coming 
months. We’re excited that our inaugural alliance partners reflect diverse businesses nationwide.” 
 
The National Small Business Association (NSBA) was among the first to adopt this initiative. “Many small 
business owners enter into business deals without establishing dispute resolution terms in their contracts,” 
said Patrick Post, NSBA vice president of membership. “Without alternative dispute resolution provisions, 
resolving disputes can be challenging. The NSBA is excited to partner with the American Arbitration 
Association to provide free resources to small business owners to help them resolve disputes with mediation, 
arbitration and other forms of dispute resolution.” 
 
The Arizona Small Business Association (ASBA), the Business Incubator Association of New York State 
(BIANYS) and the Small Business Association of Michigan (SBAM) have also recognized the long-term 
value of developing educational programs and offering accessible alternatives to litigation. 
 
“At the ASBA, we understand that small businesses are the backbone of our economy, and empowering them 
with the right tools is crucial for their success. ADR is one such tool that can be transformative. It offers a 
cost-effective and efficient way to resolve conflicts, allowing small businesses to focus on what they do best: 
driving innovation and growth,” said Robin Duncan, ASBA senior vice president of business development. 
“Our partnership with the AAA is a testament to our shared commitment to supporting small enterprises. 
Together, we aim to educate and promote ADR as an essential resource, helping businesses navigate 
challenges while fostering a thriving, resilient community.” 
 

https://www.adr.org/
https://www.icdr.org/
https://www.prnewswire.com/news-releases/american-arbitration-association-acquires-worlds-leading-online-dispute-resolution-company-transforming-the-way-courts-and-businesses-resolve-disputes-302155301.html
https://odr.com/
https://go.adr.org/small-business-entrepreneurs.html


 

The small business and entrepreneur resources platform offers information to small businesses on dispute 
prevention and resolution strategies, including using dispute resolution clauses to avoid litigation. Guides and 
other educational materials will be provided to help small businesses and entrepreneurs resolve disputes 
outside of court.  
 
For more information on the services and educational offerings, visit go.adr.org/small-business-
entrepreneurs.html.  
 
About the American Arbitration Association 
The not-for-profit AAA is the leading ADR service provider. It has administered more than eight million 
ADR cases since its founding in 1926. With offices throughout the United States and Singapore, the AAA 
provides organizations of all sizes in virtually every industry with ADR services and products. For more 
information, visit www.adr.org.  
 
About the International Centre for Dispute Resolution 
The ICDR is the international division of the AAA and the largest international provider of dispute resolution 
services. Established in 1996, the ICDR serves parties from over 100 countries with multilingual staff 
experienced in international dispute resolution proceedings and a roster of over 725 arbitrators and mediators. 
For more information, visit www.icdr.org.  
 
About ODR.com and Mediate.com (Resourceful Internet Solutions)  
ODR.com, an AAA company, is the global leader in online dispute resolution and offers a proven, secure, 
and scalable ODR platform that is used by hundreds of organizations around the world, including courts, 
universities, businesses and government agencies. Since its establishment in 1996, Mediate.com has been the 
leading mediation website, offering an extensive repository of dispute resolution resources, online courses 
and a widely utilized directory of global mediators. 
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